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The cuttlefish Sepia pharaonis, a commercially important demersal trawl fishery species,
distributes widely in the coastal waters of Taiwan. In term of morphology, the embryonic
developments of Sepia pharaonis canbe divided into 40 different stages. Itis commonly found that
some embryos hatched before completely depleting the associated yolks at the later developing
stages. It is still not well understood that the survival rate of pre-mature hatchlings, and what
and how environmental factors were involved in inducing such processes. The eggs were
hatched naturally or artificially at different developing stages and the survival rate of hatchling
at each test were compared consequently. The effects of different environmental factors on egg
hatchings at different developing stages were examined as well. The studies shows that the
hatchling artificially hatched at later developmental stages survived longer than those hatched
at earlier stages. The feeding rates of those hatchlings artificially hatched after the 36th stage
increased along with the developmental stages. The limits of temperatures on the embryonic
development of Sepia pharaonis were notlower than 10° or higher than 35 °, respectively. When
the temperature were suddenly changed, the increases in temperature can more effectively
induce the pre-mature hatching than did the decreases in temperature. The hatchings of pre-
matured hatchlings were induced by either increasing or decreasing temperature for more than
10°C. Eggs were not hatched when the salinities were lower than 10 psu and some embryos
can not survive under the salinity lower than 20 psu. The pre-mature hatchings were induced
when the salinities were suddenly declined from 33 to 10 psu. In order to get away from hostile
environmental conditions, those embryos at 39th stage have a relatively higher percentage in
pre-mature hatching than those at 36th stages which continued to grow until suitable conditions
to hatch or die as unhatched eggs.
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